
Florencie U. Patton, Principal Buyer

Email: underwoodf@jccal.org

(205) 714-3747

BID TABULATION

   85-21

COPY PAPER AND RELATED ITEMS

ITEM DESCRIPTION QTY UOM UNIT PRICE EXTENDED PRICE UNIT PRICE EXTENDED PRICE

White 20 lb. 8-1/2 x 11; Minimum 

92 Brightness Hammermill, no 

exceptions.                                               

1 CS $58.60 $58.60 $35.23 $35.23 

HAM105500 Mfg. & Product No. HAMMERMILL 11360

10 REAMS Quantity Per Case: 5,000

$58,600.00 Price Per 1000: $7,046.00

3-hole Drilled Hammermill, no 

exceptions.
1 CS $74.16 $74.16 $39.21 $39.21 

Price Per Truck Load (840 CASES) 1 TRUCKLOAD $28,128.00 $28,128.00 $28,509.60 $28,509.60 

White 20 lb. 8-1/2 x 14; Minimum 

92 Brightness Hammermill, no 

exceptions.                     

1 CS $108.00 $108.00 $49.88 $49.88 

HAM105015CT Mfg. & Product No. HAMMERMILL 11365

10 REAMS Quantity Per Case: 5,000

$108,000.00 Price Per 1000: 9,976.00

White 20 lb. 11 x 17; Minimum 92 

Brightness Hammermill, no 

exceptions.

1 CS $15.11 $15.11 $39.21 $39.21 

HAM105023 Mfg. & Product No. HAMMERMILL 11370

5 REAMS Quantity Per Case: 2,500

$15,110.00 Price Per 1000: 15,684.00

$28,383.87 

$255.87

1A

Mfg. & Product No.

Mfg. & Product No.

Quantity Per Case

Price Per 1000

ALWAYS AVAILABLE WHOLESALES & SUPPLY 

CORP.
STRICKLAND PAPER COMPANY

1 2

Quantity Per Case

Price Per 1000

GROUP 1:  COPY PAPER (WHITE) - HAMMERMILL BRAND

1B

1C Mfg. & Product No.

Quantity Per Case

  PURCHASING TOTALS - ITEMS 1A-1C 

  BIDDER'S TOTALS - ITEMS 1A-1C  

$28,673.13

$28,673.13

Price Per 1000

1 Created by F. Underwood 10/14/21



Florencie U. Patton, Principal Buyer

Email: underwoodf@jccal.org

(205) 714-3747

BID TABULATION

   85-21

COPY PAPER AND RELATED ITEMS

ITEM DESCRIPTION QTY UOM UNIT PRICE EXTENDED PRICE UNIT PRICE EXTENDED PRICE

White 20 lb. 8-1/2 x 11; Minimum 

92 Brightness Relay or approved 

equal.                  

1 CS $48.95 $48.95 $30.89 $30.89 

UNV21200 Mfg. & Product No. RELAY 79000

10 REAMS Quantity Per Case: 5,000

$48,950.00 Price Per 1000: $6,178.00

3-hole Drilled Relay or approved 

equal
1 CS $63.07 $63.07 $34.46 $34.46 

Price Per Truck Load (840 CASES) 1 TRUCKLOAD $41,118.00 $41,118.00 $25,149.60 $25,149.60 

White 20 lb. 8-1/2 x 14; Minimum 

92 Brightness Relay or approved 

equal.

1 CS $48.95 $48.95 $43.83 $43.83 

UNV21200 Mfg. & Product No. RELAY 79001

10 REAMS Quantity Per Case: 5,000

$48,950.00 Price Per 1000: $8,766.00

White 20 lb. 11 x 17; Minimum 92 

Brightness Relay or approved equal.
1 CS $63.07 $63.07 $34.46 $34.46 

UNV28110 Mfg. & Product No. RELAY 79002

5 REAMS Quantity Per Case: 2,500

$63,070.00 Price Per 1000: $13,784.00

$41,342.04 

$224.04

2

GROUP 1:  COPY PAPER (WHITE) - RELAY BRAND

1

Mfg. & Product No.

Quantity Per Case

Price Per 1000

ALWAYS AVAILABLE WHOLESALES & SUPPLY 

CORP.
STRICKLAND PAPER COMPANY

2A

Mfg. & Product No.

Quantity Per Case

Price Per 1000

  PURCHASING TOTALS - ITEMS 2A-2C 

  BIDDER'S TOTALS - ITEMS 2A-2C  

$25,293.24 

$25,293.24

2B
Mfg. & Product No.

Quantity Per Case

Price Per 1000

2C
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Florencie U. Patton, Principal Buyer

Email: underwoodf@jccal.org

(205) 714-3747

BID TABULATION

   85-21

COPY PAPER AND RELATED ITEMS

ITEM DESCRIPTION QTY UOM UNIT PRICE EXTENDED PRICE UNIT PRICE EXTENDED PRICE

White 20 lb. 8-1/2 x 11; Minimum 

92 Brightness Boise or approved 

equal.                  

1 CS $40.75 $40.75 NO BID NO BID

CASSPRC20 Mfg. & Product No. N/A-NO BID

2500 SHEETS Quantity Per Case: N/A-NO BID

$40,750.00 Price Per 1000: N/A-NO BID

3-hole Drilled Boise or approved 

equal
1 CS $74.81 $74.81 NO BID NO BID

Price Per Truck Load (840 CASES) 1 TRUCKLOAD $62,840.40 $62,840.40 NO BID NO BID

White 20 lb. 8-1/2 x 14; Minimum 

92 Brightness Boise or approved 

equal.

1 CS $90.08 $90.08 NO BID NO BID

CAS054904 Mfg. & Product No. N/A-NO BID

10 REAMS Quantity Per Case: N/A-NO BID

$90,080.00 Price Per 1000: N/A-NO BID

White 20 lb. 11 x 17; Minimum 92 

Brightness Boise or approved equal.
1 CS $73.51 $73.51 NO BID NO BID

CAS054907 Mfg. & Product No. N/A-NO BID

5 REAMS Quantity Per Case: N/A-NO BID

$90,080.00 Price Per 1000: N/A-NO BID

$63,119.55

279.15$                                   

3A

Mfg. & Product No.

Quantity Per Case

Price Per 1000

1 2

ALWAYS AVAILABLE WHOLESALES & SUPPLY 

CORP.
STRICKLAND PAPER COMPANY

GROUP 1:  COPY PAPER (WHITE) - BOISE BRAND

3B
Mfg. & Product No.

Quantity Per Case

Price Per 1000

3C
Mfg. & Product No.

Quantity Per Case

Price Per 1000

  PURCHASING TOTALS - ITEMS 3A-3C 

  BIDDER'S TOTALS - ITEMS 3A-3C  

$0.00

$0.00

3 Created by F. Underwood 10/14/21



Florencie U. Patton, Principal Buyer

Email: underwoodf@jccal.org

(205) 714-3747

BID TABULATION

   85-21

COPY PAPER AND RELATED ITEMS

ITEM DESCRIPTION QTY UOM UNIT PRICE EXTENDED PRICE UNIT PRICE EXTENDED PRICE

White 20 lb. 8-1/2 x 11; Minimum 

92 Brightness Georgia Pacific or 

approved equal.                  

1 CS $63.83 $63.83 NO BID NO BID

XER3R02047 Mfg. & Product No. N/A-NO BID

10 REAMS Quantity Per Case: N/A-NO BID

$63,830.00 Price Per 1000: N/A-NO BID

3-hole Drilled Georgia Pacific or 

approved equal
1 CS $81.84 $81.84 NO BID NO BID

Price Per Truck Load (840 CASES) 1 TRUCKLOAD $68,745.00 $68,745.00 NO BID NO BID

White 20 lb. 8-1/2 x 14; Minimum 

92 Brightness Georgia Pacific or 

approved equal.

1 CS $94.98 $94.98 NO BID NO BID

XER3R02051CT Mfg. & Product No. N/A-NO BID

10 REAMS Quantity Per Case: N/A-NO BID

$81,840.00 Price Per 1000: N/A-NO BID

White 20 lb. 11 x 17; Minimum 92 

Brightness Georgia Pacific or 

approved equal.

1 CS $15.18 $15.18 NO BID NO BID

XER3R03761 Mfg. & Product No. N/A-NO BID

5 REAMS Quantity Per Case: N/A-NO BID

$15,180.00 Price Per 1000: N/A-NO BID

$69,000.83

$173.99

4A

Mfg. & Product No.

Quantity Per Case

Price Per 1000

4B
Mfg. & Product No.

Quantity Per Case

Price Per 1000

2

ALWAYS AVAILABLE WHOLESALES & SUPPLY 

CORP.
STRICKLAND PAPER COMPANY

GROUP 1:  COPY PAPER (WHITE) - GEORGIA PACIFIC BRAND

1

4C
Mfg. & Product No.

Quantity Per Case

Price Per 1000

  PURCHASING TOTALS - ITEMS 4A-4C 

  BIDDER'S TOTALS - ITEMS 4A-4C  

$0.00

$0.00
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Florencie U. Patton, Principal Buyer

Email: underwoodf@jccal.org

(205) 714-3747

BID TABULATION

   85-21

COPY PAPER AND RELATED ITEMS

ITEM DESCRIPTION QTY UOM UNIT PRICE EXTENDED PRICE UNIT PRICE EXTENDED PRICE

All Colors 20 lb. 8-1/2 x 11 copy 

paper Hammermill, no exceptions.
1 CS $107.70 $107.70 $46.30 $46.30 

HAM103341CT Mfg. & Product No. VARIOUS HAMMERMILL 

10 REAMS Quantity Per Case: 5,000

$107,700.00 Price Per 1000: $9.26

All Colors 20 lb. 8-1/2 x 14 copy 

paper Hammermill, no exceptions.
1 CS $108.00 $108.00 $63.48 $63.48 

HAM105015CT Mfg. & Product No. VARIOUS HAMMERMILL 

10 REAMS Quantity Per Case: 5,000

$10,800.00 Price Per 1000: $12,696.00

All Colors 20 lb. 11 x 17 copy paper 

Hammermill, no exceptions.
1 CS $74.50 $74.50 $49.91 $49.91 

HAM86750 Mfg. & Product No. VARIOUS HAMMERMILL 

5 REAMS Quantity Per Case: 2,500

$74,500.00 Price Per 1000: $19,964.00

White 24 lb. 8.5 x 11 copy paper 

Fore MP Hammermill, no exceptions.
1 CS $81.14 $81.14 $49.91 $49.91 

HAM103283 Mfg. & Product No. HAMMERMILL 11168

10 REAMS Quantity Per Case: 5,000

$81,140.00 Price Per 1000: $9,982.00

All Colors, 24 lb. 8-1/2 x 11, copy 

paper Hammermill, no exceptions.
1 CS $110.90 $110.90 $52.62 $52.62 

HAM104307 Mfg. & Product No. VARIOUS HAMMERMILL 

10 REAMS Quantity Per Case: 5,000

$110,900.00 Price Per 1000: $10,524.00

$482.24

$483.04

$262.22

$262.22  BIDDER'S TOTALS - ITEMS 5-9

Price Per 1000

2

ALWAYS AVAILABLE WHOLESALES & SUPPLY 

CORP.
STRICKLAND PAPER COMPANY

GROUP II:  COPY PAPER (ALL COLORS) 

1

5
Mfg. & Product No.

Quantity Per Case

Price Per 1000

  PURCHASING TOTALS - ITEMS 5-9 

7
Mfg. & Product No.

Quantity Per Case

Price Per 1000

8
Mfg. & Product No.

Quantity Per Case

Price Per 1000

9
Mfg. & Product No.

Quantity Per Case

6
Mfg. & Product No.

Quantity Per Case

Price Per 1000
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Florencie U. Patton, Principal Buyer

Email: underwoodf@jccal.org

(205) 714-3747

BID TABULATION

   85-21

COPY PAPER AND RELATED ITEMS

ITEM DESCRIPTION QTY UOM UNIT PRICE EXTENDED PRICE UNIT PRICE EXTENDED PRICE

White  24 lb. 8-1/2 x 11, Laser 

Hammermill, no exceptions.
1 CS $61.80 $61.80 $68.10 $68.10 

HAM104604CT Mfg. & Product No. HAMMERMILL 11130

10 REAMS Quantity Per Case: 5,000

$61,800.00 Price Per 1000: $13.62

All Colors, 24 lb. 8-1/2 x 11, copy 

paper Hammermill, no exceptions.
1 CS $11.09 $11.09 $52.62 $52.62 

HAM104406 Mfg. & Product No. VARIOUS HAMMERMILL 

10 REAMS Quantity Per Case: 5,000

$11,090.00 Price Per 1000: $10,524.00

White 90 lb. 8-1/2 x 11, Index 

Springhill or approved equal.
1 CS $95.00 $95.00 $43.04 $43.04 

SGH015101 Mfg. & Product No. Springhill 41530

8 PKS. Quantity Per Case: 2,000

$95,000.00 Price Per 1000: 21.52

All Colors 90 lb. 8-1/2 x 11, Index 

Springhill or approved equal.
1 CS $15.44 $15.44 $56.35 $56.35 

SGH075300 Mfg. & Product No. VARIOUS SPRINGHILL

8 PKS. Quantity Per Case: 2,500

$15,440.00 Price Per 1000: 22.54

White 90 lb. 8-1/2 x 14, Index 

Springhill or approved equal.
1 CS NO BID NO BID $71.80 $71.80 

N/A-NO BID Mfg. & Product No. SPRINGHILL 41568

N/A-NO BID Quantity Per Case: 2,500

N/A-NO BID Price Per 1000: 28.72

$183.33

$183.33

$0.00

$202,511.86

$1,599.77

Price Per 1000

14 Mfg. & Product No.

Quantity Per Case

Price Per 1000

$54,520.50

$291.91

$0.00

12 Mfg. & Product No.

  PURCHASING TOTALS - ITEMS 10-14

  BIDDER'S TOTALS - ITEMS 10-14

EXACT TRANSPORTATION  (Freight) CHARGES - If Applicable

PURCHASING TOTALS

BIDDER'S TOTALS

$291.91

$54,520.50
GRAND TOTALS FOR GROUPS I-III

Quantity Per Case

Price Per 1000

13 Mfg. & Product No.

Quantity Per Case

GROUP III:  24 LB. PAPER AND INDEX PAPER

1 2

ALWAYS AVAILABLE WHOLESALES & SUPPLY 

CORP.
STRICKLAND PAPER COMPANY

10 Mfg. & Product No.

Quantity Per Case

Price Per 1000

11 Mfg. & Product No.

Quantity Per Case

Price Per 1000
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Florencie U. Patton, Principal Buyer

Email: underwoodf@jccal.org

(205) 714-3747

BID TABULATION

   85-21

COPY PAPER AND RELATED ITEMS

1.  Always Available Wholesale & Supply Corp. / Contact: Deborah Holt, CEO / 464 Bass Circle, NW, Huntsville, AL 35801 / Office: (256) 270-8278; Toll Free: 1-888-412-3246 / Email: sales@alwayswholesales.com

2.  Strickland Paper Co. / Contact: Beau Tynes, Vice President / 481 Republic Circle, Birmingham, AL 35214 / Toll Free: 1-800-284-4353; Fax: (205) 798-1416 / Email: beau.tynes@stricklybiz.com

*Group I: Copy Paper (White) - Boise Brand; Item #3C; Price Per 1000 was listed by Always Available Wholesale & Supply Corp. as $90,080.00, but the correct amount should be $73,510.00. Verified with vendor 11/17/21 that this was a typo error on the

vendor's part and they inadvertently took the same total from the row above in item #3B.

*Group I:  Copy Paper (White) - Georgia Pacific Brand; Item #4B; Price Per 1000 was listed by Always Available Wholesale & Supply Corp. as $81,840.00, but according to Purchasing calculations, the correct amount should be $94,980.00.  

Notification of Intent to Respond

Jefferson County, Alabama Equal Opportunity Certification Form

Affidavit of Contractor

Non-Collusion Affidavit

Signature Page

Price Sheet

Debarment Statement

REQUIRED FORMS

YES

YES

ALWAYS AVAILABLE WHOLESALES & SUPPLY 

CORP.

YES

YES

YES

YES

CONTACT INFORMATION

Purchasing Association of Central Alabama (PACA) Required Form YES YES

YES

YES

YES

YES

YES

0%

0%

5

BIDDER'S TRUCK

0%

YES

YES

YES

STRICKLAND PAPER COMPANY

NO 

24 HOURS FROM THE TIME THE COUNTY REQUESTS SERVICE 

& 72 HRS. MAXIMUM RESPONSE TIME AFTER NOTIFICATION 

OF WARRANTY ISSUE.

0%

Guaranteed maximum discount available if contract is renewed for 2
nd

 year ______ %

Guaranteed maximum discount available if contract is renewed for 3
rd

 year ______ %

Maximum Completion or Delivery Time:  ______ Days from receipt of order or notice to proceed.

Delivery will be made via Bidder's Truck, Commercial Truck, Train, Sea or Air.

DISCOUNTS:  THE FOLLOWING DISCOUNTS WILL BE CONSIDERED IN AWARD OF THE BID

B.  Payment Discount:  Discount for payment of invoice within 20 days of receipt is: ________%.  Payment 

discounts of 20 or more days will be considered in award of bid.  The County will not take discounts that are not 

earned.

2%

4%

30

COMMERCIAL TRUCK

0%

All or None Offer.  This bid is offered on an all or non basis?  _______ (Yes or No)

Warranty Response Time, If applicable.  Minimum acceptable response time is _______ from the time the 

County requests service.  Indicate maximum response time after notification of warranty issue:  _______ hrs.

NO

N/A

A.  Award of all item:  Indicate any additional discount for award of all items to your company: _______%

3%

ALWAYS AVAILABLE WHOLESALES & SUPPLY 

CORP.
STRICKLAND PAPER COMPANY

7 Created by F. Underwood 10/14/21


